Request under Freedom of Information Act 2000
Request Ref: NGFOI 16/17: 161

Thank you for your request for information received at Northampton General Hospital NHS
Trust (NGH) on 22/06/16.

I am pleased that we are now able to provide you with a response to your request as shown
below.

You requested:

1)How much money does the trust get for completing 90% of VTE assessments?
2)How much money does the trust get for completing a certain percentage of 24 hr VTE re-
assessments?
3)Total value (paid and outstanding) made by the Trust for successful clinical cases related
to the inadequate prevention and / or management of VTE acquired in hospital in each of the
following years 2010-2015
4)For the years 2012 to 2015:

-total number of cases of hospital acquired VTE,

-% of patients risk assessed for VTE on admission,

- number of cases that were preventable.

Response from Northampton General Hospital NHS Trust (NGH):
1. Nil
2. Nil
3. This information is not held by the Trust. This information may be available from
the NHS Litigation Authority (NHSLA) as the Trust does not make payments for

clinical negligence claims. The NHSLA can be contacted at:
foi@nhsla.com

4. |1 can confirm on behalf of the Trust and in accordance with S.1 (1) of the
Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA) that we do not hold the information that
you have requested for total number of cases of hospital acquired VTE as we do
not record where the VTE was acquired. We also do not record the number of
cases that were preventable.

-% of patients risk assessed for VTE on admission:

Jan-12 N/A Jan-13 91.9% Jan-14 97.8% Jan-15 97.9%
Feb-12 N/A Feb-13 92.0% Feb-14 97.7% Feb-15 98.4%
Mar-12 N/A Mar-13 90.1% Mar-14 97.2% Mar-15 97.6%
Apr-12 N/A Apr-13 92.4% Apr-14 97.4% Apr-15 97.8%
May-12 91.4% May-13 93.1% May-14 97.7% May-15 98.2%
Jun-12 90.3% Jun-13 96.1% Jun-14 97.0% Jun-15 98.0%



mailto:foi@nhsla.com

Jul-12 93.0% Jul-13 98.4% Jul-14 97.4% Jul-15 97.3%
Aug-12 90.7% Aug-13 98.1% Aug-14 95.9% Aug-15 95.0%
Sep-12 91.7% Sep-13 97.3% Sep-14 96.4% Sep-15 96.4%
Oct-12 92.5% Oct-13 97.4% Oct-14 96.9% Oct-15 97.1%
Nov-12 92.0% Nov-13 97.4% Nov-14 96.1% Nov-15 95.0%
Dec-12 90.0% Dec-13 97.6% Dec-14 96.3% Dec-15 95.6%




